
Pathfinder Bible Achievement

1 & 2 Corinthians

NUMBERS



 

• According to 1 Cor. 4:15, how 
many instructors might the 
Corinthians brethren have had?



 

10,000



 

   According to 1 Cor. 10:8, how 
many Israelites fell because of 
sexuality immorality?



 

      23,000



 

  According to 1 Cor. 14:19, in 
church Paul would rather speak 
how many words with 
understanding, than 10,000 in a 
tongue?



 

5



 

  According to 2 Cor. 8:10, for how 
long had the Corinthian brethren 
desired to contribute to the gift of 
the poor?



 

1 year



 

  According to 2 Cor. 11:2, Paul 
says he has bethrothed the 
Corinthians to what?



 

1 husband



 

   According to 2 Cor. 11:24, how 
many times did Paul receive 40 
stripes minus one?



 

5 times



 

  According to 2 Cor. 11:25, how 
many times was Paul beaten with 
rods?



 

3 times



 

  According to 2 Cor. 11:25, how 
many times was Paul stoned?



 

1 time



       

  According to 2 Cor. 11:25, how 
many times was Paul 
shipwrecked?



     

3 times



     

   According to 2 Cor. 12:2, how 
long ago was the “man in Christ” 
caught up into the third heaven?



    

14 years ago



   

   According to 2 Cor. 12:8, how 
many times did Paul plead with 
the Lord that the “thorn” might 
depart from him?



   

3 times



  

   According to 2 Cor. 12:14, Paul 
says he is ready to come to 
Corinth for which time?



 

  The 3rd time



   

   According to 2 Cor. 13:1, how 
many times will Paul have come 
to Corinth when he visits?



 

3 times



 

   According to 2 Cor. 13:1, every 
word shall be established by how 
many witnesses?



 

2 or 3



 

  According to 1 Cor. 14:19, in 
church Paul would rather speak 5 
words with understanding, than 
how many words in a tongue?



  

10,000



   

  According to 1 Cor. 14:27, in 
church how many should be 
allowed to speak in a tongue in 
turn?



 

2 or at the most 3



  

  According to 1 Cor. 14:29-31, if 
prophets want to speak at church, 
how many should be allowed to 
speak?



 

2 or 3



 

  According to 1 Cor. 15:6, how 
many people saw Christ at one 
time after He was resurrected?



 

Over 500



 

   According to 1 Cor. 15:5, after 
Cephas saw the resurrected 
Christ, who saw Him?



  

  The 12



  

   According the SDABC 655, when 
was the oldest extant manuscript 
of 1 Corinthians written?



 

3rd Century A.D.



 

   According to SDABC 655, how 
long did Paul labor in Ephesus?



 

  3 years



 

  According to SDABC 655, 
Ephesus was the chief center of 
Paul’s activities during which one 
of his missionary journeys?



 

   3rd Missionary Journey



 

   According to SDABC 655, what is 
the date for 1 Corinthians?  (Be 
specific)



  

Spring of A.D. 57



 

  According to SDABC 655, during 
which of Paul’s missionary 
journeys was the church at 
Corinth established?



 

2nd Missionary Journey



 

  According to SDABC 655, how 
long did Paul stay at Corinth 
during his 2nd Missionary Journey 
when the church was established 
there?



 

18 months



 

   According to SDABC 656, it was a 
legal requirement to have how 
many women officiating as 
courtesans, or public prostitutes 
in the temple of Aphrodite?



 

1,000



 

  According to SDAABC 656, how 
long had Paul been absent from 
the time he founded the church in 
Corinth until he wrote 

  1 Corinthians?



 

3 years



 

  According to the SDABC 821, 
what is the date of the oldest 
extant manuscript of 

  2 Corinthians?



 

3rd Century A.D.



 

   According to the SDABC 821, 
how long after Paul wrote 

  2 Corinthians did Clement of 
Rome write to the church in 
Corinth?



 

About 35 years



 

   According to SDABC 821, how 
many times does Clement of 
Alexandria quote from 

  2 Corinthians?



 

Not less than 20 times



 

   According to SDABC 822, how 
many visits did Paul make to the 
church at Corinth?



  

At least 3



 

   According to SDABC 822, how 
many epistles to the church at 
Corinth did Paul write?



 

3, perhaps 4



 

   According to the SDABC, p. 822, 
what is the date of Paul’s first visit 
to the church at Corinth?



 

About A.D. 51



 

  According to SDABC 822, Paul 
first visited the church at Corinth 
during which of his missionary 
journeys?



 

2nd Missionary Journey



 

  According to SDABC 822, how 
long did Paul’s first visit to Corinth 
last?



 

A year and a half



 

   According to SDABC 822, what 
text mentions Paul’s first written 
contact with the church at 
Corinth?



 

1 Cor. 5:9



  

   According to SDABC 822, when 
during his stay in Ephesus did 
Paul write 1 Corinthians?



 

Toward the close of 
more than 2 years



  

  According to SDABC 822, during 
which of Paul’s missionary 
journeys did Paul write 

  1 Corinthians?



 

3rd Missionary Journey



 

   According to SDABC 822, some 
people think that the “distressing 
and disappointing visit” of Paul to 
Corinth was which of his visits?



 

2nd visit



 

  According to SDABC 822, what is 
the date for the writing of 

  2 Corinthians?



 

About A.D. 57



 

   According to SDABC 823, when 
did Clement of Rome write an 
epistle to the Corinthians?



 

About A.D. 95
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